


certificate of attendance from the clerk of the court must also be submitted. The 
certificate of attendance should show inclusive dates of jury duty or witness service and 
any amount of fees the court paid to the employee. The certificate of attendance should 
separately identify fees and other allowances or expenses. Fees received by the 
employee are collected; however, moneys received in the form of allowances or 
reimbursement for expenses (such as transportation or parking expenses) are not 
collected. If the certificate of attendance does not identify allowances separately, then 
all moneys are considered fees and must be collected. The employee may keep 
reimbursements for expenses received from the court, authority, or party that caused 
the employee to be summoned and may keep fees that exceed the employee’s 
compensation for the days of service. An employee serving on a jury in a state or local 
court who waives or refuses to accept jury fees is still liable to the U.S. Government for 
the fees they would have received. 

If fees are paid incorrectly to an employee who is serving in a nonofficial capacity, then 
the employee may not retain the fees. The fees must be turned in to the CSR at the 
employing activity. An employee may keep reimbursements for expenses received from 
the court, authority, or party that caused the employee to be summoned. 

When a holiday occurs during the time an employee is on jury duty or witness service, 
the employee may keep the jury duty or witness service fee paid for the holiday. 

If called to jury duty on a non-workday, then the employee may keep the fees paid. 

Moneys submitted for fees collected by employees for jury duty or witness service must 
be accounted for on a DoD (DD) Form 1131 (Cash Collection Voucher). Credit the 
appropriation and accounting classification that paid the employee’s salary while the 
employee was on jury duty or serving as a witness with these moneys.  

Any questions should be addressed to your servicing Human Resource Specialist 
(L/MER) in the Civilian Human Resource Agency-Fort Knox. 


